BUYER:

BRENDA SENSIBAUGH

6831 OF AWARD
NEBRASKA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

OPENING DATE: DECEMBER 12, 2023

MULTIPLE TRAFFIC CABINETS

GENERAL TRAFFIC CONTROLS

TRAFFIC CONTROL CORP.

LINE #

DESCRIPTION

Qry

uom

UNIT

EXTENDED PRICE
PRICE

UNIT

EXTENDED PRICE
PRICE

332

LS CABINETS

302 SUPERIOR ST.
LINCOLN NE 68521

N

4425S. 108TH ST
OMAHA NE 68145-0461

w

1001 ALASKA AVE.
NORFOLK NE 68701-2201

H

3305 W. Old Potash Hwy.
GRAND ISLAND NE 68802-1488

15

ul

140375 RUDELL ROAD
GERING, NE 68802-1488

(o)}

2400 W. 14th St.
NORTH PLATTE NE 69101-1108

~

619 AUDITORIUM DRIVE
MCCOOK NE 69001-3569

o]

602 E 1ST ST.
VALENTINE NE 69201

EA

$ 13,100.00| $ 196,500.00

$ 14,670.00 | $ 220,050.00

336

LS CABINETS

iy

302 SUPERIOR ST.
LINCOLN NE 68521

N

4425S. 108TH ST
OMAHA NE 68145-0461

w

1001 ALASKA AVE.
NORFOLK NE 68701-2201

~

3305 W. Old Potash Hwy.
GRAND ISLAND NE 68802-1488

w1

140375 RUDELL ROAD
GERING, NE 68802-1488

(o)}

2400 W. 14th St.
NORTH PLATTE NE 69101-1108

~

619 AUDITORIUM DRIVE
MCCOOK NE 69001-3569

o]

602 E 1ST ST.
VALENTINE NE 69201

EA

$ 10,218.00 | $ 51,090.00

$12,030.00 | $ 60,150.00

ATC

352 CABINET

-

302 SUPERIOR ST.
LINCOLN NE 68521

N

4425S. 108TH ST
OMAHA NE 68145-0461

w

1001 ALASKA AVE.
NORFOLK NE 68701-2201

H

3305 W. Old Potash Hwy.
GRAND ISLAND NE 68802-1488

Ul

140375 RUDELL ROAD
GERING, NE 68802-1488

)]

2400 W. 14th St.
NORTH PLATTE NE 69101-1108

~

619 AUDITORIUM DRIVE
MCCOOK NE 69001-3569

00

602 E 1ST ST.
VALENTINE NE 69201

EA

S 16,037.00| $ 48,111.00

$19,585.00| $ 58,755.00

ATC

356 CABINET

302 SUPERIOR ST.
LINCOLN NE 68521

4425S. 108TH ST
OMAHA NE 68145-0461
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BUYER: BRENDA SENSIBAUGH 6831 OF AWARD OPENING DATE: DECEMBER 12, 2023
NEBRASKA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

1001 ALASKA AVE.
NORFOLK NE 68701-2201

w

3305 W. Old Potash Hwy.
GRAND ISLAND NE 68802-1488

IS

140375 RUDELL ROAD 3 EA S 14,508.00| $ 43,524.00 | $18,170.00| $ 54,510.00

GERING, NE 68802-1488

wul

2400 W. 14th St.
NORTH PLATTE NE 69101-1108

(o)}

619 AUDITORIUM DRIVE
MCCOOK NE 69001-3569

~

602 E 1ST ST.
VALENTINE NE 69201

o]

VSA CABINETS

302 SUPERIOR ST.

1[LINCOLN NE 68521

4425S. 108TH ST

2|OMAHA NE 68145-0461

1001 ALASKA AVE.

3|NORFOLK NE 68701-2201

3305 W. Old Potash Hwy.
4|GRAND ISLAND NE 68802-1488
140375 RUDELL ROAD
5|GERING, NE 68802-1488

2400 W. 14th St.

6|NORTH PLATTE NE 69101-1108
619 AUDITORIUM DRIVE
7|MCCOOK NE 69001-3569

602 E 1ST ST.

8|VALENTINE NE 69201

5 EA NOBID NO BID

AUTOGATE CABINET

302 SUPERIOR ST.

1[LINCOLN NE 68521

4425S. 108TH ST

2|OMAHA NE 68145-0461

1001 ALASKA AVE.

3|NORFOLK NE 68701-2201

3305 W. Old Potash Hwy.
4|GRAND ISLAND NE 68802-1488
140375 RUDELL ROAD
5|GERING, NE 68802-1488

2400 W. 14th St.

6|NORTH PLATTE NE 69101-1108
619 AUDITORIUM DRIVE
7|MCCOOK NE 69001-3569

602 E 1ST ST.

8|VALENTINE NE 69201

5 EA NO BID NO BID

CAMERA-TOWER CABINETS

302 SUPERIOR ST.

1[LINCOLN NE 68521

4425S. 108TH ST

2|OMAHA NE 68145-0461

1001 ALASKA AVE.

3|NORFOLK NE 68701-2201

3305 W. Old Potash Hwy.
4|GRAND ISLAND NE 68802-1488
140375 RUDELL ROAD
5|GERING, NE 68802-1488

2400 W. 14th St.

6|NORTH PLATTE NE 69101-1108

5 EA NO BID $ 4,900.00 | $ 24,500.00

20F3



BUYER: BRENDA SENSIBAUGH 6831 OF AWARD

OPENING DATE: DECEMBER 12, 2023
NEBRASKA DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

619 AUDITORIUM DRIVE
7|MCCOOK NE 69001-3569

602 E 1ST ST.
8|VALENTINE NE 69201

CATALOG(NON- CORE ITEMS)

TOTAL: S 339,225.00 S 417,965.00
PAYMENT TERMS: %,30 DAYS
DELIVERY DAYS ARO: 150 DAYS

ATC 352 CABINET STATE WIDE LOW
VOLTAGE PRICE $16065.00
ATC 356 CABINET STATEWIDE PRICE LOW
VOLTAGE $14547.00

COMMENTS:
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